
F E E D B A C K  R E P O R T for

Skyline Solar LLC
Customer Feedback Summary
Of 12 surveys sent, 8 were responded to

Clean & Safe 100%

Problem Resolution 100%

Quality Of Workmanship 100%

Sales Knowledge 88%

Schedule 86%

Likely to Recommend 100%

Professional & Organized 88%

Quality Of Materials 100%

Work Done Right 88%

Installation Crew 88%

Recent Reviews & Published Comments
C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Dec 05, 2012

We are very happy with our project, plus it looks
great from a cosmetic standpoint. We have a lot of
people stop by to look at the project and ask us
questions about it.
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GUILDMEMBER SINCE 2012

As a GuildQuality Guildmember,

Skyline Solar LLC relies on our

customer surveying to help them

deliver an exceptional customer

experience.

We have surveyed customers on

behalf of Skyline Solar LLC in

Howell, NJ; Clark, NJ; Piscataway,

NJ; South Orange, NJ; North

Brunswick, NJ; Blairstown, NJ; East

Brunswick, NJ; Long Valley, NJ;

Hillsborough, NJ; Allenwood, NJ; and

2 other cities in New Jersey.

Page 1 of 3 Visit www.guildquality.com to learn more about the customer feedback in

this report. Visit skylinesolarnj.com for more about Skyline Solar LLC.
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Skyline Solar LLC
C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Dec 05, 2012

Cary was great. Also, and one of the owners, the one
who came out for the final inspection, was very
personable, but I don't know his name. He made me
feel very comfortable and I was glad that he was here.
I wasn't sure if someone was coming out for the
inspection, but it was nice to have him here and it
made me feel more comfortable. He spent a good 3 or
4 hours with me, it was fantastic.

C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Dec 05, 2012

The installation crew and Cary, were all great. Cary
was the go-to person. He was very organized and just
had all the answers, especially for my husband who is
a more technical person. Cary was able to answer all
of his questions. However, we were not happy with
the electrician.

C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Dec 05, 2012

We have already referred a couple of people to
Skyline Solar.

C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Nov 30, 2012

I would recognize Peter, he was good and did a lot of
follow up. Also the installation crew who installed the
racking and the solar panel.

C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Nov 30, 2012

I was satisfied with the workmanship, the way the
final product looks, and that is it running fine.

C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Nov 26, 2012

Ryan.

C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Nov 26, 2012

The crew was phenomenal and extremely great.

C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Nov 26, 2012

They were really great.
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C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Nov 21, 2012

the process from sales to installation was done in a
professional manner

C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Nov 21, 2012

Everyone we dealt with was extremely helpful and
proffesional. A special thanks to Allie, who was
always pleasant and polite and willing to go above
and beyond.

C O M M E N T

Additional Comment
Nov 21, 2012

Everyone we dealt with and those that did work at our
home were responsive to our questions, and needs.
The work crew left our property very neat and clean
and worked very efficiently. .
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