
F E E D B A C K  R E P O R T for
Fresh Coat Painters of Richardson
R E V I E W

Charles H.
Garland, TX
Jun 28, 2021

Did good work but been waiting almost 2 months to
get the runs repaired.they was very quick to start ans
finish job but when it comes to follow up I’m still
waiting almost two months for run repair.

R E V I E W

Yolanda C.
Rowlett, TX
Jun 22, 2021

Dave and his team did a great job with the staining of
our cabinets. From the start, Dave took the necessary
time to walk us through our project. I like that Dave is
highly involved throughout the project while being
completed. The onsite team makes sure that the work
area is kept neat and they are very polite. We would
highly recommend Fresh Coat of Richardson

R E V I E W

Yolanda C.
Rowlett, TX
May 22, 2021

Dave and his team did an exceptional job staining our
kitchen and bathroom cabinets. We were so pleased
with the quality of work and professionalism
provided. We’d definitely recommend them.

R E V I E W

Bev B.
Plano, TX
Apr 16, 2021

Fresh Coat Painters of Richardson were GREAT to
work with. They gave me all my options, took time to
walk me through them, and delivered an excellent
customer experience and paint job. They showed up
exactly when they said they would, and cleaned up
everything each evening. Also the price was
reasonable. I highly recommend them.

R E V I E W

Melanie A.
McKinney, TX
Apr 05, 2021

Fresh Coat of Richardson was wonderful, on time and
did a immaculate job, to the inside and outside of my
house. David Campbell was very hands on from the
beginning to the end. I would highly recommend!!!

R E V I E W

Vicki L.
Dallas, TX
Oct 14, 2020

Could not be more pleased with the overall
experience. David was so professional and personable
also. His crew did a GREAT job!?
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As a GuildQuality Guildmember,

Fresh Coat Painters of Richardson

relies on our customer surveying to

help them deliver an exceptional

customer experience.

We have surveyed customers on

behalf of Fresh Coat Painters of

Richardson in Richardson, TX;

Dallas, TX; Plano, TX; Rowlett, TX;

Heath, TX; Rockwall, TX; Mesquite,

TX; Sachse, TX; Mckinney, TX; East

Tawakoni, TX; and 9 other cities in

Texas.
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this report. Visit www.freshcoatpainters.com/FreshCoatofRichardson for

more about Fresh Coat Painters of Richardson.
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Angela M.
Allen, TX
Sep 05, 2020

Fresh Coat Painters did a fantastic job in our home!
Our home is updated and looks new. We especially
appreciated the fact that they made every effort to
ensure that we were pleased with the job they did. We
love their work! We will have them come again in the
future.

R E V I E W

Tracy S.
Sachse, TX
Aug 27, 2020

Fantastic work and we are very happy with the
exterior paint job done to our home. David kept us
informed every step of the way and we really
appreciated his attention to detail. I highly
recommend Fresh Coat Painters of Richardson.

R E V I E W

Jackie E.
Dallas, TX
Jun 24, 2020

I was very pleased with the professionalism and
timeliness of the job.
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